
Project Name:  CNS Produce Bid #2107 7/12/2021

Item Description
Arnold Fruit 

Company

Buddys 

Produce

FreshPoint 

Oklahoma
GoFresh

Bananas $17.00 $23.50 $26.70 $18.50

Gala Apples $21.00 $36.45 $34.55 $31.00

Granny Smith Apples $21.00 $38.90 $40.80 $31.00

Red Delicious Apples $19.00 $32.45 $33.60 $29.95

Golden Delicious Apples $21.00 $29.90 $37.55 $31.00

Broccoli, Florets $17.00 $23.95 $27.50 $19.95

Broccoli, Bunch $11.00 $17.50 $22.40 $21.95

Cabbage, Green $11.00 $22.50 $27.40 $16.50

Cabbage, Red $11.00 $24.40 $30.30 $22.50

Carrots $10.00 $17.95 $27.35 $27.50

Carrots, Baby $19.00 $22.95 $32.40 $18.50

Carrots, Sticks $22.00 $24.95 $28.00 $23.95

Carrots, Coins $20.00 $24.95 $28.45 $18.50

Cantaloupe $10.00 $18.95 $25.30 $19.95

Cauliflower, Head $11.00 $21.75 $25.40 $21.00

Cauliflower, Florets $17.00 $25.75 $29.60 $25.80

Celery, Stalks $20.00 $28.50 $25.45 $27.90

Celery, Sticks $20.00 $29.50 $35.40 $26.25

Cucumber $10.00 $25.95 $30.25 $18.75

Eggs, Fresh $12.00 $18.50 $17.60 $19.85

Garlic $6.00 $68.75 $22.18 $14.85

Grapes, Green $18.00 $29.95 $48.60 $32.00

Grapes, Red $18.00 $28.95 $33.00 $31.00

Grapes, White $18.00 $29.95 $44.25 No bid

Grapefruit $15.00 $24.95 $39.00 $33.00

Kiwi $20.00 $26.20 $19.00 $18.95

Lettuce, Iceberg $14.00 $22.50 $30.35 $22.95

Lettuce, Romaine $14.00 $23.95 $29.50 $23.85

Lettuce, Shredded $12.00 $17.95 $23.30 $16.95

Mango $10.00 $8.75 $12.10 $10.95

Melon, Honeydew $10.00 $18.55 $24.50 $17.85

Mushrooms $13.00 $12.95 $22.65 $19.95

Nectarines $18.00 $36.50 $55.00 No bid

Onion, Green $3.00 $18.25 $22.50 $15.85

Onion, Red $9.00 $16.95 $15.40 $14.85
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Onion, Yellow $10.00 $18.75 $18.89 $17.25

Oranges $18.00 $27.40 $36.50 $28.85

Peaches $18.00 $32.95 $37.00 No bid

Pears $24.00 $44.90 $50.50 $42.95

Peppers, Green Bell $14.00 $21.35 $22.50 $16.75

Peppers, Red Bell $7.00 $36.95 $32.50 $18.95

Peppers, Yellow Bell $7.00 $18.95 $34.50 $24.50

Plums $18.00 $26.95 $22.00 $24.00

Potatoes, Red $11.00 $24.50 $20.50 $31.00

Potatoes, Sweet $11.00 $22.95 $24.50 $16.95

Potatoes, White/Baking $11.00 $19.95 $17.50 $15.95

Radishes $14.00 $16.50 $21.05 $22.00

Salad mix with Romaine $14.00 $19.95 $24.00 $18.95

Slaw Mix $12.00 $17.95 $19.00 $15.85

Spinach $12.00 $21.50 $23.00 $17.20

Squash, Yellow $10.00 $17.95 $20.75 $17.25

Squash, Zucchini $10.00 $16.95 $17.35 $16.65

Strawberries $12.00 $19.75 $28.00 $18.95

Tangerines $13.00 $28.75 $41.00 No bid

Tomatoes, Cherry $10.00 $21.95 $22.50 $21.25

Tomatoes, Grape $10.00 $21.95 $23.90 $19.85

Tomatoes, Whole $12.00 $19.50 $16.50 $18.50


